
 

FOUNDATION FOR HELLENIC STUDIES— ILLINOIS CHAIR IN HELLENIC STUDIES 
 
The Department of Classics and Mediterranean Studies and the Department of History in the 
College of Liberal Arts and Sciences (LAS) at the University of Illinois at Chicago (UIC) invite 
applications and nominations for the endowed chair “Foundation for Hellenic Studies—Illinois 
Chair in Hellenic Studies.” We seek a scholar in the humanities with a research focus on any 
aspect of Hellenic Studies, broadly understood. Areas of research focus may range from 
antiquity to the foundation of the modern Greek state to the present. Preference will be given to 
scholars who demonstrate in their research or teaching diachronic expertise in Greek culture and 
history. The appointment will reside in the Department of Classics and Mediterranean Studies or 
the Department of History. Shared appointments between these two units may be possible when 
appropriate.  
 
The successful candidate will provide leadership in Hellenic Studies and develop a compelling 
and sustainable plan for excellence in research, teaching, service, and community engagement. 
The endowed “Foundation for Hellenic Studies—Illinois Chair in Hellenic Studies” will work 
with key units and communities at UIC and the Chicago metropolitan area to promote the value 
of Hellenic history and culture through scholarship, teaching, student engagement, and 
community outreach. 
 
The Department of Classics and Mediterranean Studies and the Department of History are 
comprised of renowned scholars working in a wide range of fields in the humanities, with 
expertise in literary studies, cultural studies, linguistics, interdisciplinary studies, women and 
gender studies, and history. The ideal candidate will complement and expand these departments 
and the university’s present research and educational strengths, mission, and goals. Modern 
Greek is presently offered as a language option for our students. 
 
UIC is an R1 institution with an established reputation for excellence in research. It is also 
proudly a minority-serving institution with a racially, ethnically, and economically diverse 
student body. Candidates should address how their professional experience and activities have 
prepared them to further UIC's distinct research and access mission and an inclusive liberal arts 
education in LAS. 
 
The desired appointment date is August 16, 2022. Salary is competitive based on qualifications. 
To apply, complete an online application at https://jobs.uic.edu and upload a cover letter, full 
curriculum vitae, and the names and full contact information of four references. For information 
about the application processes, please contact Kathy Lesinski at lesinski@uic.edu. For 
information about the position, please contact Rosilie Hernández, Associate Dean and Chair of 
the Committee at rosieher@uic.edu. Nominations should be forwarded to Dean Astrida Orle 

https://jobs.uic.edu/


 

Tantillo at las_dean@uic.edu and Rosilie Hernández at rosieher@uic.edu by August 15, 2021, to 
receive full consideration. Applications should be received by September 29, 2021, to receive 
full consideration. 
 
Duties: 
 
The “Foundation for Hellenic Studies—Illinois Chair in Hellenic Studies” will develop and 
implement a compelling vision for Hellenic Studies at UIC, maintain an active national and 
international research agenda, teach at the undergraduate and graduate level, purposefully 
support the academic success of a diverse student population, participate in the intellectual life of 
the department(s), establish fruitful collaborations with other scholars at UIC, provide service to 
the department(s), the college and the university, and create an innovative and sustainable 
program for community engagement in the Chicago metropolitan area.  
 
Qualifications: 
 
The successful candidate will have a Ph.D., a distinguished record of scholarship, evidence of 
excellence in teaching and service, and proven experience with community outreach and 
engagement. 
 
This is a tenured position, and candidates should preferably be eligible for appointment at the 
rank of full; associate professors may be considered.  
 
The University of Illinois at Chicago is an affirmative action, equal opportunity employer 
dedicated to the goal of building a culturally diverse and pluralistic faculty and staff committed 
to teaching and working in a multicultural environment. We are committed to equal employment 
opportunity regardless of race, color, national origin, sex, religion, age, sexual orientation, 
gender identity, Veteran, or disability status. 
 
 The University of Illinois may conduct background checks on all job candidates upon 
acceptance of a contingent offer. Background checks will be performed in compliance with the 
Fair Credit Reporting Act. 
 
The University of Illinois System requires candidates selected for hire to disclose any 
documented finding of sexual misconduct or sexual harassment and to authorize inquiries to 
current and former employers regarding findings of sexual misconduct or sexual harassment. 
For more information, visit 
https://www.hr.uillinois.edu/cms/One.aspx?portalId=4292&pageId=1411899 
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